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Abstract 

The purpose of the study is to identify the important aspects of quality of life 
assessed in children with cochlear implant. Parental Perspective question-
naire with modified in Bangla was used as a data collection tool in this study. 
Data was collected through face to face interview with 25 parents of children 
with Cochlear Implant (CI) attended at Bangabandhu Sheikh Mujib Medical 
University, Dhaka. Among 25 cochlear implant children, the boys (12) and 
girls (13) were nearly the same. Results indicated that the majority of the 
children had difficulties with communication with known people (48.00%) 
and before implantation children with CI obtained no benefit at all from 
hearing aids (76.00%). However, the research finding shows that they are 
largely satisfied with the outcomes from implantation. Improvement of social 
relationship, family well-being, within the family, educational condition, and 
self-reliance was satisfactorily reported by the parents. This study would help 
the clinician, speech pathologist, children and parents to raise awareness 
about the impact of CI and its treatment.  
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1. Introduction 

Cochlear Implant (CI) is an electronic device that is implanted into the ear sur-
gically to provide a sense of sound to the deaf or patients who have hearing im-
pairment. Cochlear implantation is to facilitate spoken language development. 
Therefore, oral/auditory methodologies of language learning are typically rec-
ommended for deaf children with cochlear implants [1]. Deaf children do not 
have the same auditory access as their hearing peers; therefore, their speech and 
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listening abilities are often limited [2]. In the United States, roughly 38,000 de-
vices have been implanted in children [3]. Many cochlear implant operations 
have been done to over 150,000 people including both children and adults 
worldwide [4]. It is noted that 43% of the subjects implanted before the age of 2 
and 16% of the subjects implanted before 4 years of age achieved speech and 
language skills equivalent to their normal hearing peers [5]. Children may learn 
to use the sensations provided by their implants in different ways, so audiome-
tric measures do not tell us directly about the child’s use of the implant in eve-
ryday life; this is why they are often complemented by measures of language de-
velopment and educational achievement [6]. Parents, educators, family mem-
bers, and anyone in contact with implant users should understand cochlear im-
plants as much as possible. Children who were identified with hearing loss by 6 
months of age and received early intervention had significantly better speech 
and language outcomes compared to children whose hearing loss was identified 
after 6 months of age [7]. Children with hearing loss have explained children’s 
developmental patterns in relation to the various processes associated with lan-
guage and literacy acquisition (e.g., phonemic awareness, speech perception, 
fluency, vocabulary, and reading comprehension) in typically developing child-
ren [8]. According to Dunn & Munn (2008), hearing loss is the most common 
congenital birth defect, affecting 2 - 3 newborns out of every 1000 born in the 
United States [9] [10]. The World Health Organization (1998) defines quality of 
life as a broad multi-dimensional paradigm that includes subjective evaluations 
of gratification or satisfaction with one’s life and activities of daily living [11]. 
This study would be helpful to add knowledge and in making speech and lan-
guage therapist awareness about the quality of life for parents of children with 
cochlear implants. Investigator would be professionally taken concerned with 
the organization for the quality of life for children with cochlear implants. 
Speech and language therapists can use this information for doing best practice 
by parents of children communication and concerning functional well-being 
status of the cochlear implants children.  

Description of CI (Cochlear Implant) Device 

Cochlear implants are electronic devices which have both surgically implanted 
and externally worn parts. This is designed to enhance hearing abilities [12]. It 
consists of a receiver/stimulator that is surgically implanted under the skin, be-
hind the ear with a magnet and an electrode array. It is implanted into the coch-
lea and provides direct electrical stimulation to the nerve fibers. The external 
parts include a microphone, a speech processor, and a transmitting coil that are 
placed behind the ear [6]. 
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2. Methodology  

Investigator conducted the study in Bangabandhu Sheikh Mujib Medical Uni-
versity (BSMMU), Dhaka & data was collected from 29th November 2015 to 
25th December 2015. The population of the study was parents of children with 
cochlear implants. Investigator selected 25 children cochlear implant as a par-
ticipant to conduct this study. It is a judgmental sampling process where indi-
viduals are selected purposely based on the study and investigator selected par-
ticipants according to the aim and objectives of the study [13]. Data was col-
lected from face to face interview with considering the following inclusion & ex-
clusion criteria. 
 Parents of children in both genders aged from 2 to 12 years old. 
 Parents of children with the cochlear implant of more than 6 months. Both 

unilateral and bilateral cochlear implant children.  
 Parents of children with CI with other associated disabilities (neurological 

and behavioral, global development disorder, mild mental impairment, cere-
bral palsy and diagnosis of meningitis) were excluded. 

To assess Quality of Life (QOL), the questionnaire (CCIPP) was used, a spe-
cific tool for the pediatric population using CI [14]. The CCIPP consist of 42 
general questions divided into seven primary QOL domains: Communication 
well-being, Social-relationship well-being, Family well-being, General function-
ing well-being, Self-reliance well-being, Effects of Implantation and education 
well-being. Parents are asked to tick their responses to the statements on a Likert 
scale, ranging from strongly agree, agree, neither agree nor disagree, disagree 
and strongly disagree. Higher scores for the scales and subscales indicate better 
quality of life [15]. The Investigator used descriptive statistics for data analysis. 
The percentages of each domain were statistically analyzed using SPSS software. 
After getting permission from the institute, investigator took an academic per-
mission letter which was approved the principal of BHPI for the study in Ban-
gabandhu Sheikh Mujib Medical University (BSMMU). Permission was also 
taken from the study in Bangabandhu Sheikh Mujib Medical University 
(BSMMU) to collect data. After getting permission from the authority of the 
study at Bangabandhu Sheikh Mujib Medical University (BSMMU), investigator 
started data collection from the participants.  

3. Results 

Study revealed that among 25 CI children, boys (12) and girls (13) were almost 
the same. Most of (44%) the children with CI were 5 - 6 years old. About half of 
respondents’ (52.0%) professions were house wife. Regarding the educational 
status of parents, maximum (40%) completed graduate level as shown in Table 
1. 

Analysis of descriptive statistics and Table 2 shows that mean age in years was 
7.2 (±1.52625) followed by mean age at the time of surgery was 3.6360 (±1.07776) 
and mean time of using CI was 3.5800 (±1.3105). 
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Table 1. Demographic information of the participants (n = 25). 

Variables Number (n) Percent (%) 

Age of the children 

5 - 6 Years 11 44 

7 - 8 Years 9 36 

9 - 10 Years 5 20 

Sex of the children 

Boy 12 48 

Girl 13 52 

Parents professions 

House wife 13 52.0 

Teacher 4 16.0 

Others 8 32.0 

Educational level of parents 

Primary level 2 8 

High school 9 36 

College 4 16 

Graduate 10 40 

 
Table 2. Descriptive statistics of children with CI. 

Variables n Minimum Maximum Mean Std. deviation 

Age in years 25 5.00 10.00 7.2120 1.52625 

Age at the time of surgery 25 1.00 6.00 3.6360 1.07776 

Time of using cochlear implants 25 2.00 6.00 3.5800 1.31053 

 
Figure 1 shows that the majority of the participants (48.00%) respond disag-

ree that their children had difficulties with communication with known people. 
More than half of the participants (64.00%) answered agree that the quality of 
their child’s speech gives them a cause for concern. About 44.00% participants 
was neither agreed nor disagree can on the point of chatting without seeing the 
face. Most of the parents (40.00%) had agreed that they can communicate with 
children by speaking. Majority of the parents of children with CI (56.00%) ans-
wered agreed on developing their child’s spoken language. Maximum child was 
reported with neither agreed and disagreed by their parents and they had talked 
and engaged others in conversation. 

Figure 2 revealed that about two third of (76%) responded strongly agreed 
that before implantation child obtained no benefit at all from hearing aids. More 
than half of (68.00%) parents had strongly agreed that the children were totally 
reliant on implant all the time. About 48.00% participants agreed that their 
children knew when s/he (children) wanted to get their attention and another  
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Figure 1. Communication of the children with CI. 
 

 
Figure 2. General-functioning of the children with CI. 
 
48.00% participants were neither agree nor disagree about this issue. 48.00% 
participants responded that their children could amuse themselves by listening 
to music or watching TV or playing games. 40.00% participants have strongly 
disagreed that they had now let her/him play outside as s/he aware of the sound 
of traffic and another (36.00%) participants were disagreed. 32.00% participants 
answered that s/he still unable to cope in new situations.  
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Figure 3 demonstrates that more than half of (56.00%) participants were 
strongly disagreed that s/he (children) still shows signs of frustration do some-
thing on own. Majority of the parents (72.00%) agree that they had significant 
changes of improvement in confidence. More than two third of participants 
(84.00%) answered strongly agree that s/he (children) were very dependent on 
parents before the implantation. 36.00% participants have disagreed that child-
ren independent as most other children of their age and another (36.00%) par-
ticipants neither agree nor disagree. Regarding family well-being about 48.00% 
have agreed that their children showed signs of frustration in behavior. Majority 
of the parents (56.00%) were agreed that their child’s behavior had improved 
since implantation. 48.00% participants was agreed that their children became 
argumentative since getting the implant. 40.00% participants were strongly disa-
greed that s/he (children) is less frustrated than before the implantation and 
36.00% were disagree. Most of the parents (84.00%) were strongly agreed that 
their children continued to be a happy child. as shown in Figure 4. 

Figure 5 shows that Majority of the parents (68.00%) were strongly disagreed 
that their children did not have a close relationship with grandparents. 40.00% 
participants were agreed that their children were socially isolated before getting 
implant and 56.00% sociable within the family. 36.00% participants responded 
neither agree nor disagree that the children did not make friends easily outside 
the family. Most of the participants (68.00%) were agreed that their children 
shared family situations more than before implantation and 64.00% participants 
were agreed about the child’s relationship with brothers and sisters has been im-
proved.  

Analysis of the education and Figure 6 demonstrates that most of the partici-
pants (64.00%) were strongly agreed that their children were totally reliant on 
implant at school. 44.00% participants were agreed that they had a concern  

 
 

 
Figure 3. Self-reliance of the children with CI. 
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Figure 4. Family well-being of the children with CI. 
 

 
Figure 5. Social-relationship of the children with CI. 
 
about the child’s future school placement. 48.00% participants were agreed that 
they (parents) should have a choice in the use of sign language at school. 40.00% 
participants were happy about their child’s progress at school another 36.00% 
neither agreed nor disagree. 32.00% participants were agreed that s/he (child’s) 
was unable to cope with mainstream schooling and another 32.00% have disa-
greed. 28.00% participants were agreed that s/he (children) is keeping up well 
with children of his/her own age at school and another 28.00% were disagreed. 

Figure 7 demonstrates that 72.00% participants have strongly disagreed that 
the immediately after implantation their children ability to communicate was 
poorer. 48.00% participants were strongly agreed that their children progress 
during the first few months seemed very slow and another 40.00% were agreed.  
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Figure 6. Education of the children with CI. 
 

 
Figure 7. Effects of Implantation among the children with CI. 
 
56.00% participants have strongly agreed that their children needed more help 
from received their child’s implant and another 40.00% were agreed. 44.00% 
participants responded neither agree nor disagree that their children blame them 
for the decision to have been implantation. 44.00% participants responded were 
neither agree nor disagree that progress after implantation has exceeded parent’s 
expectations. Majority of the participants (64.00%) responded were neither agree 
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nor disagree that get more time to themselves because of their child’s increased 
independence. 56.00% participants strongly agreed that their children needed 
more help from them since received their child’s implantation and another 
40.00%% were agreed. 40.00% participants were responded neither agree nor 
disagreed that a lot of help at first means a children needed less help later.  

4. Discussion 

The study revealed on parent’s perspective that their children were happy, 
communicative, and talkative and satisfied with their child’s education. The 
great changes of this study were about spoken language that developed greatly 
after implantation, which helps to a conversation with others. On the other 
hand, previous study found that after implantation major outcomes being im-
provements in communication skills, social relationships and self-reliance [16]. 
The strongest response of all in this study was that parents reported agreeing 
that they were able to attract their child’s attention by calling them, thus making 
communication within the family easier [17]. In another study, parents reported 
that the change to spoken language at home rather than sign language and the 
child’s preference for spoken language as it was the easiest means of communi-
cation. In this study, most of the parents (64.00%) answered agree that the qual-
ity of their children speech gave them a cause for concern [18]. Beadle et al. 
(2005) showed that speech intelligibility is improving even five or ten years after 
implantation [19]. The present study was carried out after implantation, and 
therefore it is likely that the quality of the speech of these children has been im-
proved according to parents. Results from this study suggest the majority of the 
parents (68.00%) responded agree that their children were totally reliant on their 
implant all the time. In a more recent study from interviews with young people 
with implants was the lack of information about their implant systems [20]. 
Parents also reported significant changes in confidence as found by Archbold et 
al. [14]. In this study, the majority of the parents (72.00%) agree that they had 
significant changes of improvement in confidence. Cowan (1997) reported that 
the cost-benefits of pediatric cochlear implantation are largely dependent on 
how much rehabilitation the children need after implantation [21]. The parents 
of profoundly deaf children in the present study strongly agree (56.00%) with 
the statement that their children need more support from them after implanta-
tion. A major issue for parents in this study was that their child had become very 
sociable within the family, sharing family situations, close to grandparents and 
with improved relationships with their siblings. In this study, most of the par-
ents (68.00%) were respond strongly disagree that their children did not have a 
close relationship with grandparents. The everyday language of the home, of 
siblings and grandparents after implantation facilitates full participation in fam-
ily life.18 Education remains a major issue for parents [22]. Although parents 
report that they are largely happy with their child’s education, a significant pro-
portion are concerned about the future and feel their child is not keeping up 
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with other children of the same age. The attainment of mainstream schooling 
has been seen as a measure of the success of cochlear implantation [23]. The 
majority of the children in the present study were in mainstream education, with 
32.00% parents were agreed and 32.00% parents disagreed integrated into the 
mainstream school. With regard to the communication mode in school, over 
80% of parents felt that they should have a say in the use of sign language in 
school. A study by Watson et al. (2007) interviewing parents about the changes 
from using sign language to spoken language found that parents wanted to be 
able to choose communication mode [18]. Christiansen and Leigh (2004) also 
found in their study that although parents wanted to spoke the language for their 
child, they also supported the use of sign language before and after implantation 
[17]. Spencer (2004) also suggests that it may be possible to find a way forward 
using both sign language and implants and more flexible thinking in considering 
communication choices would be helpful [6]. In this study, majority of children 
in the study used signed communication to some extent prior to implantation 
and changed to using spoken communication over the years following implanta-
tion, as became increasingly useful and confirms others that, while parents have 
the major goal of spoken language for their children, a majority also value the 
use of sign or signed support at times. 

5. Conclusion 

It is concluded that parents are mostly satisfied with the results from implanta-
tion. Their children have developed with a social relationship, family well-being, 
and communication within the family after implantation. Children may learn to 
use the sensations provided by their implants in different ways, so audiometric 
measures do not tell us directly about the child’s use of the implant in everyday 
life. This is why they are often complemented by measures of language develop-
ment and educational achievement. Children who present with congenital deaf-
ness have the potential to reach speech and language outcomes comparable to 
hearing peers following cochlear implantation. Parents need to be patient as 
progress takes time, and a number remain concerned about future education, 
self-reliance, the use of spoken language and feel that outcomes from implanta-
tion have not met their expectations. So, speech and language therapist has an 
important role to play at each of these stages aims to contribute to the assess-
ment, treatment, maximizing and maintenance of abilities relating to general 
functioning, spoken language and communication. 

6. Limitation of the Study 

This is the first primary study on QOL for children with CI from the perspective 
of their parents in Bangladesh. So there were some limitations and barriers dur-
ing conducting the study. The study was done within short period of time and 25 
participants or parents were selected to conduct the whole study. It was a small 
number of participants to conduct a survey to find out QOL for children with 
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CIs. Data was collected in Bangla, so there might be a possibility to drop or fall 
the original meaning of information given by the participants. But the investiga-
tor tried to give the original resources in this study. Time and resource were li-
mited that have a great deal of impact on the study. Investigator did not get any 
financial support to conduct the study and so it was not possible to move and 
gather more participants or parents from different hospitals around Bangladesh.  
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